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In response to violence and human rights violations in the mining of certain minerals from the 
Democratic Republic of the Congo (“DRC”) or adjoining countries, the U.S. Securities and Exchange 
Commission adopted rules to implement reporting and disclosure requirements related to “conflict 
minerals,” as directed by Section 1502 of the Dodd-Frank Wall Street Reform and Consumer 
Protection Act of 2010 (“Section 1502”).  

Cricut, Inc. (“Cricut”) is subject to Section 1502, which defines Conflict Minerals as cassiterite (tin), 
coltan (tantalum), wolframite (tungsten) and gold (or derivatives of these minerals), or any other 
mineral or its derivatives determined to be financing conflict in the DRC or an adjoining country.  

As a manufacturer of products that contain Conflict Minerals, we are committed to avoiding minerals 
that originate or support conflict or high-risk areas. We support the goals of Section 1502, which 
requires public companies like Cricut to conduct supply chain due diligence regarding Conflict 
Minerals that are necessary to the functionality or production of a product manufactured or 
contracted for manufacture and that originate in the DRC or adjoining countries. We support 
responsible sourcing of Conflict Minerals from the DRC and adjoining countries in accordance with 
the Organisation for Economic Co-operation and Development’s Due Diligence Guidance for 
Responsible Supply Chains of Minerals from Conflict-Affected and High-Risk Areas and the 
supplements thereto (“OECD Guidance”). 

We expect our suppliers to source Conflict Minerals from smelters and refiners that have completed 
an industry standard independent third-party Conflict Minerals audit and require that such suppliers 
have policies in place to conduct responsible Conflict Minerals sourcing within their own supply 
chains that conform to the OECD Guidance. We require that in-scope suppliers (those for whom 
Conflict Minerals are necessary to the functionality or production of a product that we sell) annually 
provide to Cricut, in a timely manner following any request, a complete, accurate and current 
Responsible Minerals Initiative Conflict Minerals Reporting Template. 

We will continue to monitor global developments and the emergence of additional requirements or 
standards related to the sourcing of minerals or other materials from the DRC and adjoining 
countries or other regions to continually improve our Conflict Minerals program.  


